
 JUNIOR MISSION & VISION

BALLARAT-REDAN CRICKET CLUB

At the Ballarat-Redan Cricket Club, our primary goal is to create a positive and nurturing environment where
young cricketers can develop their skills, foster a love for the game, and grow both as athletes and individuals.
We are committed to providing a safe, inclusive, and enjoyable experience for all our members, while upholding
the values of teamwork, sportsmanship, and fair play. 

MISSION FOR SUCCESS:
Player Development: We believe in a holistic approach to player development, emphasizing skill improvement,
tactical understanding, physical fitness, and mental resilience.

Inclusivity: We welcome players of all skill levels, backgrounds, and abilities, ensuring that everyone has the
opportunity to participate and contribute to the team's success.

Safety: The safety and well-being of our players are paramount. We maintain rigorous safety protocols and
prioritize responsible coaching practices.

Sportsmanship: We instil values of respect, humility, and integrity in our players, encouraging them to compete
with sportsmanship and respect for opponents, coaches, and officials and spectators.

Parental/Guardians Involvement: We actively engage parents and guardians in the development process,
fostering a strong sense of community and collaboration.

VISION FOR SUCCESS:
Our vision at the Ballarat-Redan Cricket Club is to be recognised as a leading junior cricket program that not only
produces skilled cricketers but also contributes positively to the personal growth and character development of
its members. Our vision includes:

Excellence in Coaching: We aim to provide top-notch coaching that focuses on skill enhancement, tactical
understanding, and personal growth, delivered by experienced and dedicated coaches.
Player-Centric Approach: Our success is measured by the progress of each player. We aspire to see all our players reach
their full potential while enjoying the journey.

Positive Team Culture: We envisage envision a team culture built on camaraderie, respect, and mutual support,
where players learn to work together, overcome challenges, and celebrate successes as a unit.

Pathway to Higher Levels: We strive to prepare our junior cricketers for higher levels of competition, helping
them transition smoothly to senior cricket or representative teams, if desired.

Community Engagement: Beyond the field, we aim to be an active contributor to the local community through
outreach programs, workshops, and events that promote cricket and its values.

Creating Lifelong Passion: Our ultimate goal is to ignite a lifelong passion for cricket in our players, ensuring that
they carry the lessons learned and the love for the game with them into adulthood.

By adhering to our policy and working towards our vision, we are confident that the Ballarat-Redan Cricket Club
will continue to be a place where young cricketers thrive, learn, and enjoy the journey of becoming exceptional
athletes and responsible individuals.


